ORDINANCE NO. 10924
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE CHATTANOOGA CITY CODE, PART II, CHAPTER 4, WHICH CHAPTER IS KNOWN AS “THE CHATTANOOGA AIR POLLUTION CONTROL ORDINANCE” BY PROVIDING FOR REVISIONS TO PERMIT FEES AND PART 70 OPERATING PERMIT EMISSIONS FEES.


WHEREAS, it is the declared public policy of this city to achieve and maintain such levels of air quality as will protect human health and safety, and to the greatest degree practicable, prevent injury to plant and animal life and property, foster the comfort and convenience of the people; and


WHEREAS, local regulation of air quality is the most efficient means toward that end; and


WHEREAS, in order to maintain the Certificate of Exemption granted by the Tennessee Air Pollution Control Board it is necessary to adopt regulations no less stringent than state standards; and


WHEREAS, the adoption of these amendments is required for the protection of the health, safety and welfare of the people of Chattanooga and to insure maintaining the local Certificate of Exemption and an approved Part 70 Operating Permit Program;


NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CHATTANOOGA, TENNESSEE, That Chapter 4 of Part II of the Chattanooga City Code be amended as is hereinafter set forth:

Section 1.
That Section 4-8(a)(14), SCHEDULE 4-8-A-I. FUEL-BURNING EQUIPMENT of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting “$390.00” and substituting in lieu thereof “$415.00”; and by deleting “$450.00” and substituting in lieu thereof “$480.00”; and by deleting “600.00” and substituting in lieu thereof “$640.00”.

Section 2.
That Section 4-8(a)(14), SCHEDULE 4-8-A-II. INCINERATORS of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting SCHEDULE 4-8-A-II. INCINERATORS in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following new schedule for installation permits:
SCHEDULE 4-8-A-II. INCINERATORS


Fees shall be assessed based upon the manufacturers rated input as expressed in pounds per hour.

Input in Pounds Per Hour








Fee

Up to 200









$ 
  65.00

200 to 599









 
 130.00

500 to 999









  
 180.00

1,000 to 1,999









  
 255.00

2,000 to 4,999









  
 320.00

5,000 to 9,999









  
 385.00

10,000 or greater








  
 450.00 


+ $60.00 for each additional 100 lbs/hr over 10,000 lbs/hour

Section 3.
That Section 4-8(a)(14), SCHEDULE 4-8-A-III. PROCESS EQUIPMENT of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting SCHEDULE 4-8-A-III. PROCESS EQUIPMENT in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following new schedule for installation permits:
SCHEDULE 4-8-A-III. PROCESS EQUIPMENT

Fees shall be assessed and based upon the process weight per hour as expressed in pounds per hour.

Input Process Weight











(Pounds per Hour)









Fee
Up to 999









$
130.00

1,000 to 9,999









  
225.00

10,000 to 49,999








  
320.00

50,000 to 149,000








  
415.00

150,000 to 499,999








  
510.00

500,000 to 999,999








  
605.00

1,000,000 or greater








  
640.00 

(NOTE:  Examples of this type of equipment include: chemical processing equipment; crushing, grinding or milling equipment; metal forming equipment.) 

Section 4.
That Section 4-8(a)(14), SCHEDULE 4-8-A-IV ODOR PRODUCING EQUIPMENT of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting “ninety dollars ($90.00)” and substituting in lieu thereof “two hundred fifty-five dollars ($255.00)”.
Section 5.
That Section 4-8(a)(14), SCHEDULE 4-8-A-V. MISCELLANEOUS of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting “ninety dollars ($90.00)” and substituting in lieu thereof “two hundred fifty-five dollars ($255.00)”.

Section 6.
That Section 4-8(c)(12)b., SCHEDULE 4-8-C-I. FUEL-BURNING EQUIPMENT of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting SCHEDULE 4-8-C-I. FUEL-BURNING EQUIPMENT in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following new schedule for initial certificates of operation:

SCHEDULE 4-8-C-I. FUEL-BURNING EQUIPMENT

1,000 BTU per Hour









Fee
Up to 150









$
160.00

150 to 399







 

 
 225.00

400 to 649









 
 290.00

650 to 1,4999









 
 350.00

1,500 to 2,499









 
 415.00

2,500 to 4.999









 
 480.00

5,000 to 14,999








 
 545.00

15,000 or greater








 
 640.00

Section 7.
That Section 4-8(c)(12)b., SCHEDULE 4-8-C-II. INCINERATORS of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting SCHEDULE 4-8-C-II. INCINERATORS in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following new schedule for initial certificates of operation:

SCHEDULE 4-8-C-II. INCINERATORS

Input in Pounds Per Hour








Fee
Up to 200









  
225.00

200 to 599









  
255.00

600 to 999









  
290.00

1,000 to 1,999









  
320.00

2,000 to 4,999









  
350.00

5,000 to 9,999









  
385.00

10,000 or greater








  
415.00


+$30 for each additional 100 lbs/hr over 10,000 lbs/hr

Section 8.
That Section 4-8(c)(12)b., SCHEDULE 4-8-C-III. PROCESS EQUIPMENT of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting SCHEDULE 4-8-C-III PROCESS EQUIPMENT in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following new schedule for initial certificates of operation:

SCHEDULE 4-8-C-III. PROCESS EQUIPMENT

Input Process Weight

 (Pounds Per Hour)









Fee
Up to 999









$
290.00

1,000 to 9,999









  
385.00

10,000 to 49,999








  
480.00

50,000 to 149,999








  
575.00

150,000 and greater








  
640.00

Section 9.
That Section 4-8(c)(12)b., SCHEDULE 4-8-C-IV. ODOR PRODUCING EQUIPMENT of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting “$390.00” and substituting in lieu thereof “$320.00”.
Section 10.
That Section 4-8(c)(12)b., SCHEDULE 4-8-C-V. MISCELLANEOUS OF SAID Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting “$390.00” and substituting in lieu thereof “$320.00”.

Section 11.
That Section 4-8(c)(12)c., SCHEDULE 4-8-C-VI. FUEL-BURNING EQUIPMENT of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting SCHEDULE 4-8-C-VI. FUEL-BURNING EQUIPMENT in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following new schedule for renewal certificates of operation:

SCHEDULE 4-8-C-VI. FUEL-BURNING EQUIPMENT

1,000 BTU per Hour









Fee
Up to 150









$   
  65.00

150 to 399







 

    
  95.00

400 to 649









 
290.00

650 to 1,4999









 
350.00

1,500 to 2,499









 
415.00

2,500 to 4.999









 
480.00

5,000 to 14,999








 
545.00

15,000 or greater








 
640.00

Section 12.
That Section 4-8(c)(12)c., SCHEDULE 4-8-C-VII. INCINERATORS of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting SCHEDULE 4-8-C-VII. INCINERATORS in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following new schedule for renewal certificates of operation:

SCHEDULE 4-8-C-VII. INCINERATORS

Input in Pounds Per Hour








Fee
Up to 200









$    
  50.00

200 to 599









      
  65.00 
600 to 999









      
  95.00

1,000 to 1,999









 
130.00

2,000 to 4,999









  
160.00

5,000 to 9,999









  
195.00

10,000 or greater








  
225.00

Section 13.
That Section 4-8(c)(12)c., SCHEDULE 4-8-C-VIII. PROCESS EQUIPMENT of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting SCHEDULE 4-8-C-VIII. PROCESS EQUIPMENT in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following new schedule for renewal certificates of operation:
SCHEDULE 4-8-C-VIII. PROCESS EQUIPMENT

Input Process Weight

 (Pounds Per Hour)









Fee
Up to 999









$
160.00

1,000 to 9,999









            225.00

10,000 to 49,999








  
290.00

50,000 to 149,999








  
350.00

150,000 to 499,999








  
415.00

500,000 to 999,999








  
480.00

1,000,000 or greater








  
545.00

Section 14.
That Section 4-8(c)(12)c., SCHEDULE 4-8-C-IX. ODOR PRODUCING EQUIPMENT of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting “$90.00” and substituting in lieu thereof “$130.00”.
Section 15.
That Section 4-8(c)(12)c., SCHEDULE 4-8-C-X. MISCELLANEOUS of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting “$90.00” and substituting in lieu thereof “$130.00”.
Section 16.
That Section 4-60(e)(6) of said Chapter 4 be, and hereby is, amended by deleting “$29.32” and substituting in lieu thereof “$31.33”.

Section 17.
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that Chattanooga City Code Supplement No. 1, Part II, Chapter 4 (1998), codifying ordinances as previously adopted, and Ordinance Nos. 10785 and 10786, be construed to be cumulative in effect, and it is here declared to be the legislative intent that compliance with any one or more provisions of that Chapter shall not be construed as a defense for non-compliance with any other applicable provisions of the Code or the Ordinance or rules or regulations thereof nor with any applicable provisions of that Chapter.
Section 18.
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that if any section part of a section, sentence, clause or phrase of this Ordinance is for any reason declared to be unconstitutional or otherwise invalid by any court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity of any other portion of this Ordinance, and only such invalid portion shall be elided from this ordinance.

SECTION 19.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that this Ordinance shall take effect two (2) weeks from and after its passage, the public welfare requiring it.

PASSED on Third and Final Reading


November 2

, 1999.

S/















CHAIRPERSON







APPROVED:
   X
DISAPPROVED:








DATE:

November 4, 1999
            







S/________________________________________









        MAYOR

3
6

